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1a. I believe that the Constitution must be interpreted in light of the society that it seeks to 
organize. 
 
With respect to substantive due process regarding matters involving the family, the dissent in 
Dobbs v. Jackson Women’s Health Organization competently captures my approach to 
constitutional interpretation. It reads in relevant part: 
 

Indeed, the ratifiers—both in 1868 and when the original Constitution was 
approved in 1788—did not understand women as full members of the community 
embraced by the phrase “We the People.” In 1868, the first wave of American 
feminists were explicitly told—of course by men—that it was not their time to 
seek constitutional protections. (Women would not get even the vote for another 
half-century.) To be sure, most women in 1868 also had a foreshortened view of 
their rights: If most men could not then imagine giving women control over their 
bodies, most women could not imagine having that kind of autonomy. But that 
takes away nothing from the core point. Those responsible for the original 
Constitution, including the Fourteenth Amendment, did not perceive women as 
equals, and did not recognize women’s rights. When the majority says that we 
must read our foundational charter as viewed at the time of ratification (except that 
we may also check it against the Dark Ages), it consigns women to second-class 
citizenship.  
 
Casey itself understood this point, as will become clear. See infra, at 23–24. It 
recollected with dismay a decision this Court issued just five years after the 
Fourteenth Amendment’s ratification, approving a State’s decision to deny a law 
license to a woman and suggesting as well that a woman had no legal status apart 
from her husband. See 505 U. S., at 896–897 (majority opinion) (citing Bradwell 
v. State, 16 Wall. 130 (1873)). “There was a time,” Casey explained, when the 
Constitution did not protect “men and women alike.” 505 U. S., at 896. But times 
had changed. A woman’s place in society had changed, and constitutional law had 
changed along with it. The relegation of women to inferior status in either the 
public sphere or the family was “no longer consistent with our understanding” of 
the Constitution. Id., at 897. Now, “[t]he Constitution protects all individuals, male 
or female,” from “the abuse of governmental power” or “unjustified state 
interference.” Id., at 896, 898.  
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So how is it that, as Casey said, our Constitution, read now, grants rights to 
women, though it did not in 1868? How is it that our Constitution subjects 
discrimination against them to heightened judicial scrutiny? How is it that our 
Constitution, through the Fourteenth Amendment’s liberty clause, guarantees 
access to contraception (also not legally protected in 1868) so that women can 
decide for themselves whether and when to bear a child? How is it that until today, 
that same constitutional clause protected a woman’s right, in the event 
contraception failed, to end a pregnancy in its earlier stages?  
 
The answer is that this Court has rejected the majority’s pinched view of how to 
read our Constitution. “The Founders,” we recently wrote, “knew they were 
writing a document designed to apply to ever-changing circumstances over 
centuries.” NLRB v. Noel Canning, 573 U. S. 513, 533–534 (2014). Or in the 
words of the great Chief Justice John Marshall, our Constitution is “intended to 
endure for ages to come,” and must adapt itself to a future “seen dimly,” if at all. 
McCulloch v. Maryland, 4 Wheat. 316, 415 (1819). That is indeed why our 
Constitution is written as it is. The Framers (both in 1788 and 1868) understood 
that the world changes. So they did not define rights by reference to the specific 
practices existing at the time. Instead, the Framers defined rights in general terms, 
to permit future evolution in their scope and meaning. And over the course of our 
history, this Court has taken up the Framers’ invitation. It has kept true to the 
Framers’ principles by applying them in new ways, responsive to new societal 
understandings and conditions.  
 
Nowhere has that approach been more prevalent than in construing the majestic 
but open-ended words of the Fourteenth Amendment—the guarantees of “liberty” 
and “equality” for all. And nowhere has that approach produced prouder moments, 
for this country and the Court. Consider an example Obergefell used a few years 
ago. The Court there confronted a claim, based on Washington v. Glucksberg, 521 
U. S. 702 (1997), that the Fourteenth Amendment “must be defined in a most 
circumscribed manner, with central reference to specific historical practices”—
exactly the view today’s majority follows. Obergefell, 576 U. S., at 671. And the 
Court specifically rejected that view.4 In doing so, the Court reflected on what the 
proposed, historically circumscribed approach would have meant for interracial 
marriage. See ibid. The Fourteenth Amendment’s ratifiers did not think it gave 
black and white people a right to marry each other. To the contrary, 
contemporaneous practice deemed that act quite as unprotected as abortion. Yet 
the Court in Loving v. Virginia, 388 U. S. 1 (1967), read the Fourteenth 
Amendment to embrace the Lovings’ union. If, Obergefell explained, “rights were 
defined by who exercised them in the past, then received practices could serve as 
their own continued justification”—even when they conflict with “liberty” and 
“equality” as later and more broadly understood. 576 U. S., at 671. The 
Constitution does not freeze for all time the original view of what those rights 
guarantee, or how they apply.  
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That does not mean anything goes. The majority wishes people to think there are 
but two alternatives: (1) accept the original applications of the Fourteenth 
Amendment and no others, or (2) surrender to judges’ “own ardent views,” 
ungrounded in law, about the “liberty that Americans should enjoy.” Ante, at 14. 
At least, that idea is what the majority sometimes tries to convey. At other times, 
the majority (or, rather, most of it) tries to assure the public that it has no designs 
on rights (for example, to contraception) that arose only in the back half of the 
20th century—in other words, that it is happy to pick and choose, in accord with 
individual preferences. See ante, at 32, 66, 71–72; ante, at 10 (KAVANAUGH, J., 
concurring); but see ante, at 3 (THOMAS, J., concurring). But that is a matter we 
discuss later. See infra, at 24–29. For now, our point is different: It is that 
applications of liberty and equality can evolve while remaining grounded in 
constitutional principles, constitutional history, and constitutional precedents. The 
second Justice Harlan discussed how to strike the right balance when he explained 
why he would have invalidated a State’s ban on contraceptive use. Judges, he said, 
are not “free to roam where unguided speculation might take them.” Poe v. 
Ullman, 367 U. S. 497, 542 (1961) (dissenting opinion). Yet they also must 
recognize that the constitutional “tradition” of this country is not captured whole at 
a single moment. Ibid. Rather, its meaning gains content from the long sweep of 
our history and from successive judicial precedents—each looking to the last and 
each seeking to apply the Constitution’s most fundamental commitments to new 
conditions. That is why Americans, to go back to Obergefell’s example, have a 
right to marry across racial lines. And it is why, to go back to Justice Harlan’s 
case, Americans have a right to use contraceptives so they can choose for 
themselves whether to have children.  
 
All that is what Casey understood. Casey explicitly rejected the present majority’s 
method. “[T]he specific practices of States at the time of the adoption of the 
Fourteenth Amendment,” Casey stated, do not “mark[ ] the outer limits of the 
substantive sphere of liberty which the Fourteenth Amendment protects.” 505 U. 
S., at 848.5 To hold otherwise—as the majority does today—“would be 
inconsistent with our law.” Id., at 847. Why? Because the Court has “vindicated 
[the] principle” over and over that (no matter the sentiment in 1868) “there is a 
realm of personal liberty which the government may not enter”—especially 
relating to “bodily integrity” and “family life.” Id., at 847, 849, 851. Casey 
described in detail the Court’s contraception cases. See id., at 848–849, 851–853. 
It noted decisions protecting the right to marry, including to someone of another 
race. See id., at 847–848 (“[I]nterracial marriage was illegal in most States in the 
19th century, but the Court was no doubt correct in finding it to be an aspect of 
liberty protected against state interference”). In reviewing decades and decades of 
constitutional law, Casey could draw but one conclusion: Whatever was true in 
1868, “[i]t is settled now, as it was when the Court heard arguments in Roe v. 
Wade, that the Constitution places limits on a State’s right to interfere with a 
person’s most basic decisions about family and parenthood.” Id., at 849.  
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And that conclusion still held good, until the Court’s intervention here. It was 
settled at the time of Roe, settled at the time of Casey, and settled yesterday that 
the Constitution places limits on a State’s power to assert control over an 
individual’s body and most personal decisionmaking. A multitude of decisions 
supporting that principle led to Roe’s recognition and Casey’s reaffirmation of the 
right to choose; and Roe and Casey in turn supported additional protections for 
intimate and familial relations. The majority has embarrassingly little to say about 
those precedents. It (literally) rattles them off in a single paragraph; and it implies 
that they have nothing to do with each other, or with the right to terminate an early 
pregnancy. See ante, at 31–32 (asserting that recognizing a relationship among 
them, as addressing aspects of personal autonomy, would ineluctably “license 
fundamental rights” to illegal “drug use [and] prostitution”). But that is flat wrong. 
The Court’s precedents about bodily autonomy, sexual and familial relations, and 
procreation are all interwoven—all part of the fabric of our constitutional law, and 
because that is so, of our lives. Especially women’s lives, where they safeguard a 
right to self-determination.  
 
And eliminating that right, we need to say before further describing our 
precedents, is not taking a “neutral” position, as JUSTICE KAVANAUGH tries to 
argue. Ante, at 2–3, 5, 7, 11–12 (concurring opinion). His idea is that neutrality 
lies in giving the abortion issue to the States, where some can go one way and 
some another. But would he say that the Court is being “scrupulously neutral” if it 
allowed New York and California to ban all the guns they want? Ante, at 3. If the 
Court allowed some States to use unanimous juries and others not? If the Court 
told the States: Decide for yourselves whether to put restrictions on church 
attendance? We could go on—and in fact we will. Suppose JUSTICE 
KAVANAUGH were to say (in line with the majority opinion) that the rights we 
just listed are more textually or historically grounded than the right to choose. 
What, then, of the right to contraception or same-sex marriage? Would it be 
“scrupulously neutral” for the Court to eliminate those rights too? The point of all 
these examples is that when it comes to rights, the Court does not act “neutrally” 
when it leaves everything up to the States. Rather, the Court acts neutrally when it 
protects the right against all comers. And to apply that point to the case here: 
When the Court decimates a right women have held for 50 years, the Court is not 
being “scrupulously neutral.” It is instead taking sides: against women who wish to 
exercise the right, and for States (like Mississippi) that want to bar them from 
doing so. JUSTICE KAVANAUGH cannot obscure that point by appropriating the 
rhetoric of even-handedness. His position just is what it is: A brook-no-
compromise refusal to recognize a woman’s right to choose, from the first day of a 
pregnancy. And that position, as we will now show, cannot be squared with this 
Court’s longstanding view that women indeed have rights (whatever the state of 
the world in 1868) to make the most personal and consequential decisions about 
their bodies and their lives.  
 
Consider first, then, the line of this Court’s cases protecting “bodily integrity.” 
Casey, 505 U. S., at 849. “No right,” in this Court’s time-honored view, “is held 
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more sacred, or is more carefully guarded,” than “the right of every individual to 
the possession and control of his own person.” Union Pacific R. Co. v. Botsford, 
141 U. S. 250, 251 (1891); see Cruzan v. Director, Mo. Dept. of Health, 497 U. S. 
261, 269 (1990) (Every adult “has a right to determine what shall be done with his 
own body”). Or to put it more simply: Everyone, including women, owns their 
own bodies. So the Court has restricted the power of government to interfere with 
a person’s medical decisions or compel her to undergo medical procedures or 
treatments. See, e.g., Winston v. Lee, 470 U. S. 753, 766–767 (1985) (forced 
surgery); Rochin v. California, 342 U. S. 165, 166, 173–174 (1952) (forced 
stomach pumping); Washington v. Harper, 494 U. S. 210, 229, 236 (1990) (forced 
administration of antipsychotic drugs).  
 
Casey recognized the “doctrinal affinity” between those precedents and Roe. 505 
U. S., at 857. And that doctrinal affinity is born of a factual likeness. There are few 
greater incursions on a body than forcing a woman to complete a pregnancy and 
give birth. For every woman, those experiences involve all manner of physical 
changes, medical treatments (including the possibility of a cesarean section), and 
medical risk. Just as one example, an American woman is 14 times more likely to 
die by carrying a pregnancy to term than by having an abortion. See Whole 
Woman’s Health v. Hellerstedt, 579 U. S. 582, 618 (2016). That women happily 
undergo those burdens and hazards of their own accord does not lessen how far a 
State impinges on a woman’s body when it compels her to bring a pregnancy to 
term. And for some women, as Roe recognized, abortions are medically necessary 
to prevent harm. See 410 U. S., at 153. The majority does not say—which is itself 
ominous—whether a State may prevent a woman from obtaining an abortion when 
she and her doctor have determined it is a needed medical treatment.  
 
So too, Roe and Casey fit neatly into a long line of decisions protecting from 
government intrusion a wealth of private choices about family matters, child 
rearing, intimate relationships, and procreation. See Casey, 505 U. S., at 851, 857; 
Roe, 410 U. S., at 152–153; see also ante, at 31–32 (listing the myriad decisions of 
this kind that Casey relied on). Those cases safeguard particular choices about 
whom to marry; whom to have sex with; what family members to live with; how 
to raise children—and crucially, whether and when to have children. In varied 
cases, the Court explained that those choices—“the most intimate and personal” a 
person can make—reflect fundamental aspects of personal identity; they define the 
very “attributes of personhood.” Casey, 505 U. S., at 851. And they inevitably 
shape the nature and future course of a person’s life (and often the lives of those 
closest to her). So, the Court held, those choices belong to the individual, and not 
the government. That is the essence of what liberty requires.  
 
And liberty may require it, this Court has repeatedly said, even when those living 
in 1868 would not have recognized the claim—because they would not have seen 
the person making it as a full-fledged member of the community. Throughout our 
history, the sphere of protected liberty has expanded, bringing in individuals 
formerly excluded. In that way, the constitutional values of liberty and equality go 
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hand in hand; they do not inhabit the hermetically sealed containers the majority 
portrays. Compare Obergefell, 576 U. S., at 672–675, with ante, at 10–11. So 
before Roe and Casey, the Court expanded in successive cases those who could 
claim the right to marry—though their relationships would have been outside the 
law’s protection in the mid19th century. See, e.g., Loving, 388 U. S. 1 (interracial 
couples); Turner v. Safley, 482 U. S. 78 (1987) (prisoners); see also, e.g., Stanley 
v. Illinois, 405 U. S. 645, 651–652 (1972) (offering constitutional protection to 
untraditional “family unit[s]”). And after Roe and Casey, of course, the Court 
continued in that vein. With a critical stop to hold that the Fourteenth Amendment 
protected same-sex intimacy, the Court resolved that the Amendment also 
conferred on same-sex couples the right to marry. See Lawrence, 539 U. S. 558; 
Obergefell, 576 U. S. 644. In considering that question, the Court held, “[h]istory 
and tradition,” especially as reflected in the course of our precedent, “guide and 
discipline [the] inquiry.” Id., at 664. But the sentiments of 1868 alone do not and 
cannot “rule the present.” Ibid.  
 
Casey similarly recognized the need to extend the constitutional sphere of liberty 
to a previously excluded group. The Court then understood, as the majority today 
does not, that the men who ratified the Fourteenth Amendment and wrote the state 
laws of the time did not view women as full and equal citizens. See supra, at 15. A 
woman then, Casey wrote, “had no legal existence separate from her husband.” 
505 U. S., at 897. Women were seen only “as the center of home and family life,” 
without “full and independent legal status under the Constitution.” Ibid. But that 
could not be true any longer: The State could not now insist on the historically 
dominant “vision of the woman’s role.” Id., at 852. And equal citizenship, Casey 
realized, was inescapably connected to reproductive rights. “The ability of women 
to participate equally” in the “life of the Nation”—in all its economic, social, 
political, and legal aspects—“has been facilitated by their ability to control their 
reproductive lives.” Id., at 856. Without the ability to decide whether and when to 
have children, women could not—in the way men took for granted—determine 
how they would live their lives, and how they would contribute to the society 
around them.  
 
For much that reason, Casey made clear that the precedents Roe most closely 
tracked were those involving contraception. Over the course of three cases, the 
Court had held that a right to use and gain access to contraception was part of the 
Fourteenth Amendment’s guarantee of liberty. See Griswold, 381 U. S. 479; 
Eisenstadt, 405 U. S. 438; Carey v. Population Services Int’l, 431 U. S. 678 
(1977). That clause, we explained, necessarily conferred a right “to be free from 
unwarranted governmental intrusion into matters so fundamentally affecting a 
person as the decision whether to bear or beget a child.” Eisenstadt, 405 U. S., at 
453; see Carey, 431 U. S., at 684–685. Casey saw Roe as of a piece: In “critical 
respects the abortion decision is of the same character.” 505 U. S., at 852. 
“[R]easonable people,” the Court noted, could also oppose contraception; and 
indeed, they could believe that “some forms of contraception” similarly implicate 
a concern with “potential life.” Id., at 853, 859. Yet the views of others could not 
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automatically prevail against a woman’s right to control her own body and make 
her own choice about whether to bear, and probably to raise, a child. When an 
unplanned pregnancy is involved— because either contraception or abortion is 
outlawed—“the liberty of the woman is at stake in a sense unique to the human 
condition.” Id., at 852. No State could undertake to resolve the moral questions 
raised “in such a definitive way” as to deprive a woman of all choice. Id., at 850.  
 
Faced with all these connections between Roe/Casey and judicial decisions 
recognizing other constitutional rights, the majority tells everyone not to worry. It 
can (so it says) neatly extract the right to choose from the constitutional edifice 
without affecting any associated rights. (Think of someone telling you that the 
Jenga tower simply will not collapse.) Today’s decision, the majority first says, 
“does not undermine” the decisions cited by Roe and Casey—the ones involving 
“marriage, procreation, contraception, [and] family relationships”—“in any way.” 
Ante, at 32; Casey, 505 U. S., at 851. Note that this first assurance does not extend 
to rights recognized after Roe and Casey, and partly based on them—in particular, 
rights to same-sex intimacy and marriage. See supra, at 23.6 On its later tries, 
though, the majority includes those too: “Nothing in this opinion should be 
understood to cast doubt on precedents that do not concern abortion.” Ante, at 66; 
see ante, at 71–72. That right is unique, the majority asserts, “because [abortion] 
terminates life or potential life.” Ante, at 66 (internal quotation marks omitted); 
see ante, at 32, 71–72. So the majority depicts today’s decision as “a restricted 
railroad ticket, good for this day and train only.” Smith v. Allwright, 321 U. S. 
649, 669 (1944) (Roberts, J., dissenting). Should the audience for these too-much-
repeated protestations be duly satisfied? We think not.  

 
1b. I have been asked to author the Foreword for Volume 136 of the Harvard Law 
Review. It will be published in November 2022. I engage with originalism in that piece. 
 
2. I think you may be referring to fetuses that people of color gestate. I believe that the 
value of the pregnant person’s bodily autonomy and ability to make decisions in the 
best interests of their families and themselves exceeds the value of the fetus that they 
gestate. Systems that perpetuate poverty, the hyper-carceral state, maternal mortality 
and morbidity, infant mortality and morbidity, environmental injustice, voter 
disenfranchisement, the insufficient funding of public schools, and the inadequate 
funding of programs that provide basic necessities like food, clothing, shelter, and 
healthcare1 do not value people of color or their future families. I am skeptical of those 
who show concern for the fetuses that nonwhite people gestate without showing an 
equal concern for nonwhite babies, children, and adults. In those cases, the ostensible 
concern for the fetus strikes me as disingenuous. This explains my response to Sen. 
Cornyn’s question during the hearing. 
 

                                                      
1 Please note that this list is not exhaustive. 


