EAS13423 S.L.C.

AMENDMENT NO. Calendar No.

Purpose: To modify the requirements for cancellation of re-
moval of an alien.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES—113th Cong., 1st Sess.

S.744

To provide for comprehensive immigration reform and for
other purposes.

Referred to the Committee on and
ordered to be printed

Ordered to lie on the table and to be printed

AMENDMENT intended to be proposed by Mr. COONS

Viz:
1 At the end of section 2313, add the following:
2 (d) ELIGBIiLITY FOR CANCELLATION OF RE-
3 MOVAL.—Section 240A (8 U.S.C. 1229b) i1s amended—
4 (1) subsection (a)—
5 (A) in paragraph (1), by striking 5
6 years,” and inserting ‘3 years;”’; and
7 (B) in paragraph (2)—
8 (1) by striking “7 years” and inserting
9 “3 years”; and
10 (i) by striking ‘‘status,” and insert
11 “status;’’;

12 (2) in subsection (b)(1)—



EAS13423

O o0 N N W BB W

[a—
S

S.L.C.
2

(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking “10
years’” and inserting ‘5 years’’; and

(B) by amending subparagraph (D) to
read as follows:

“(D) establishes that removal would result
in extreme hardship to the alien’s spouse, par-
ent, or child who is a citizen of the United
States or an alien lawfully admitted for perma-
nent residence.”’; and

(3) by striking subsection (e).



